TREE & STUMP REMOVAL AND TREE TRIMMING BID #28-15 6/9/2015
TREE & STUMP REMOVAL BY SIZE
CONTRACTOR UNDER 18" 19" TO 30" 31"TO 42" 43" TO 54" OVER 54"
A CUT ABOVE TREE SERVICE $225.00 $525.00 $840.00 $1,250.00 $1,700.00
JIMAX no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
TREE AND BRUSH TRIMMING BY HOURLY RATES

STANDARD CREW SIZE ADDITIONAL WORKERS
CONTRACTOR HOURLY DAILY HOURLY DAILY
A CUT ABOVE TREE SERVICE $175.00 $1,400.00 $35.00/worker | $280.00/worker
JIMAX $180.00 $1,440.00 $60.00/worker | $480.00/worker

EMERGENCY TREE AND BRUSH TRIMMING BY HOURLY RATES

STANDARD CREW SIZE

CONTRACTOR HOURLY DAILY

JIMAX $180.00 $1,440.00
A CUT ABOVE TREE SERVICE $225.00 $1,800.00
STUMP REMOVAL

CONTRACTOR less than 13" |COST PER INCH
A CUT ABOVE TREE SERVICE 45.00/each $6.00
JIMAX no bid no bid

ADDITIONAL WORKERS

HOURLY

DAILY

$60.00/worker

$480.00/worker

$40.00/worker

$320.00/worker




