Approved Vender/Sole Bidder Item Description UuoMm Quanity Unit Price  Amount

Sherwin Industries 3 HOT POUR JOINT SEALER Pound 24000 $0.66 $15,945.60
Sherwin Industries 5 BITUMINOUS MATERIAL PREMIUM COLD PATCH PROPRIETARY MIX M120-07 Ton 900 $796.80 $717,120.00
United Ready Mix 10 CA-6 CRUSHED CONCRETE Ton 200 $12.50 $2,500.00
United Ready Mix 15A° FLOWABLE FILL Cubic Yard 100 $50.00 $5,000.00
United Ready Mix 15B HEATED MATERIAL Cubic Yard 50 $50.00 $5,000.00
United Ready Mix 15C EXTRA COST PER MINUTE Minute 300 $6.50 $325.00
United Ready Mix 15D OVERTIME Cubic Yard 20 $1.00 $300.00
United Ready Mix 16A A.CLASS SI/PV INCID. Cubic Yard 100 $108.00 $10,800.00
United Ready Mix 16B  CLASS SI/PV INCID. Cubic Yard 100 $108.00 $10,800.00
United Ready Mix 16C CLASS PP-1 PATCHING Cubic Yard 100 $115.00 $11,500.00
United Ready Mix 16D CLASS PP-1 PATCHING Cubic Yard 100 $115.00 $11,500.00
United Ready Mix 16 CLASS PP-2 HOT PATCH Cubic Yard 50 $132.00 $6,600.00
United Ready Mix 16F CLASS PP-2 HOT PATCH Cubic Yard 50 $132.00 $6,600.00
United Ready Mix 16G EXTRA BAG CEMENT Cubic Yard 10 $8.00 $80.00
United Ready Mix 16H HEATED MATERIAL Cubic Yard 50 $6.50 $325.00
United Ready Mix 16l EXTRA COST PER MINUTE Minute 100 $1.00 $100.00
United Ready Mix 16K  FIBERS IN MIX 1LB/CY Cubic Yard 200 $6.00 $1,200.00
Tazewell County Asphalt 2 BITUMINOUS MIXTURE COMPLETE Ton 2000 $90.00 $180,000.00
No Bid 1 BITUMINOUS MATERIALS MEDIUM CURING LIQUID ASPHALT MC-30 Gallon 1200

No Bid 4 BITUMINOUS MATERIAL PROPRIETARY MIX M31-95 COLD PATCH Ton 100

No Bid 6 FA-1 FILL SAND Ton 100

No Bid 7 FA-6 FILL SAND Ton 100

No Bid 8 CA-16 PEA GRAVEL Ton 100

No Bid 9 AGG. CA-6 WHITE ROCK Ton 150

No Bid 11 CRUSHED CONCRETE -PGE Ton 100

No Bid 12A  G-1 INLET CASTINGS: R-3246-A COMPLETE TY R GR Each 10

No Bid 12B  G-1 INLET CASTINGS: R-3246-A FRAME ONLY Each 5

No Bid 12C  G-1 INLET CASTINGS: R-3246-A HOOD ONLY Each 5

No Bid 12D  G-1 INLET CASTINGS: R-3246-A GRATE ONLY Each 5

No Bid 12E  G-1 INLET CASTINGS: R-3246-AL GRATE ONLY Each 15

No Bid 12F  G-2 INLET CASTINGS: R-32-90-C COMPLETE Each 5

No Bid 12G  G-2 INLET CASTINGS: R-3290-C FRAME ONLY Each 5

No Bid 12H  G-2 INLET CASTINGS: R-3290-C GRATE ONLY Each

No Bid 121 G-2 INLET CASTINGS: R-3454-B COMPLETE Each 10

No Bid 12) G-2 INLET CASTINGS: R-3454-B FRAME ONLY Each 5

No Bid 12K G-2 INLET CASTINGS: R-3454-B GRATE ONLY Each 5

No Bid 12L MANHOLE CASTINGS: R-1712 NON ROCKING FRAME & LID Each 5

No Bid 12M  MANHOLE CASTINGS: R-1712 NON ROCKING FRAME Each 2

No Bid 12N MANHOLE CASTINGS: R-1712 NON ROCKING LID Each 2

No Bid 13 BITUMINOUS MATERIAL EMULSIFIED ASPHALT CRS-2 Ton 120

No Bid 14 BITUMINOUS MATERIAL EMULSIFIED ASPHALT CRSP Ton 24

No Bid 15 EXTRA STOPS Each 10

No Bid 17A  INLET BOXES: 48 INCHES TALL Each 10

No Bid 17B  INLET BOXES: 42 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 17C  INLET BOXES: 36 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 17D  INLET BOXES: 28 INCHES OR LESS TALL Each 5

No Bid 17E INLET EXTENSIONS: 2 INCHES TALL Each 10

No Bid 17F INLET EXTENSIONS: 4 INCHES TALL Each 10

No Bid 17G  INLET EXTENSIONS: 6 INCHES TALL Each 10

No Bid 17H  INLET EXTENSIONS: 8 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 171 INLET EXTENSIONS: 12 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 17) INLET EXTENSIONS: 18 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 17K  INLET EXTENSIONS: 24 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 17L INLET EXTENSIONS: 30 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 17M  INLET EXTENSIONS: 36 INCHES TALL Each 5

No Bid 18A  HIGH PERFORMANCEMODIFIED URETHANE: WHITE Pound N/A

No Bid 188  HIGH PERFORMANCEMODIFIED URETHANE: YELLOW Pound N/A

No Bid 19 N/A Pound N/A

No Bid 20 CONTRACTION JOINT ASSEMBLIES Each N/A

No Bid 21 ANCHOR BOLTS AND RODS Each N/A



