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Low bidder in blue.

TREE & STUMP REMOVAL BY SIZE

CONTRACTOR UNDER 18" 19" TO 30" 31" TO 42" 43" TO 54" OVER 54"

A Cut Above Tree Service $155.00 $410.00 $725.00 $1,000.00 $1,350.00

JIMAX $405.00 $675.00 $945.00 $1,350.00 $1,780.00

Fred Durdel & Sons $350.00 $650.00 $925.00 $1,450.00 $1,900.00

Clean Sweep Tree Service $400.00 $800.00 $900.00 $1,200.00 $1,800.00

Hegwood Tree Service $375.00 $770.00 $2,480.00 $3,240.00 $4,170.00

Little Beaver Tree Service $750.00 $1,400.00 $2,000.00 $2,800.00 $3,500.00

Steele Construction $200.00 $550.00 $875.00 $1,200.00 $1,500.00

A Clean Sweep Tree Service is not a local contractor and may not want to come for one tree at a time.

TREE AND BRUSH TRIMMING BY HOURLY RATES

STANDARD CREW SIZE ADDITIONAL WORKERS

CONTRACTOR HOURLY DAILY HOURLY DAILY

A Cut Above Tree Service $120.00 $960.00 25.00/worker 200.00/worker

Hegwood Tree Service $124.50 $996.00 ? ?

JIMAX $144.00 $1,152.00 48.00/worker 384.00/worker

Little Beaver Tree Service $145.00 $1,160.00 ? ?

Fred Durdel & Sons $200.00 $1,500.00 40.00/worker 320.00/worker

Clean Sweep Tree Service $220.00 $2,200.00 ? ?

Steele Construction No Bid
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EMERGENCY TREE AND BRUSH TRIMMING BY HOURLY RATES

STANDARD CREW SIZE ADDITIONAL WORKERS

CONTRACTOR HOURLY DAILY HOURLY DAILY

Little Beaver Tree Service $190.00 $1,520.00 ? ?

JIMAX $214.00 $1,712.00 71.00/worker 568.00/worker

Fred Durdel & Sons $230.00 $1,700.00 40.00/worker 320.00/worker

A Cut Above Tree Service $240.00 $1,920.00 50.00/worker 400.00/worker

Clean Sweep Tree Service $277.00 $2,770.00 ? ?

Hegwood Tree Service No Bid

Steele Construction No Bid

Steele Construction No Bid

Little Beaver is not  local contractor and is not interested in

doing only this category of work. 

STUMP REMOVAL

CONTRACTOR COST PER INCH

A Cut Above Tree Service $2.50

JIMAX $3.85

Hearn Landscaping $5.00

Clean Sweep Tree Service $6.00

Fred Durdel & Sons $10.00

Little Beaver Tree Service $11.50

Steele Construction No Bid
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TREE & STUMP REMOVAL BY SERVICE ROUTE 

SERVICE ROUTE A Cut Above Fred Durdel & Sons Steele Constr. JIMAX

1 $430.00 $900.00 $700.00 $945.00

2 $1,320.00 $3,300.00 $2,025.00 $3,375.00

3 $430.00 $500.00 $600.00 $1,080.00

5 $2,300.00 $2,550.00 $3,500.00 $3,720.00

7 $4,510.00 $8,850.00 $5,800.00 $6,480.00

8 $1,060.00 $1,750.00 $1,250.00 $1,350.00

9 $9,480.00 $10,500.00 $11,175.00 $13,365.00

11 $3,400.00 $4,575.00 $3,750.00 $5,400.00

12 $4,880.00 $5,500.00 $5,050.00 $7,425.00

13 $3,990.00 $5,050.00 $5,650.00 $6,345.00

14 $940.00 $2,750.00 $1,550.00 $1,600.00

16 $4,000.00 $4,550.00 $5,400.00 $5,130.00

17 $1,020.00 $1,100.00 $5,400.00 $1,350.00

Total $37,760.00 $51,875.00 $51,850.00 $57,565.00

Steele Construction is second bidder on some routes.  He may not move into Peoria if the available work is

too low to pay for him to mobilize.

SERVICE ROUTE Hegwood Tree Service Little Beaver Tree Clean Sweep

1 $2,100.00 $755.00 No Bid

2 $5,676.00 $4,360.00 No Bid

3 $513.00 $1,025.00 No Bid

5 $3,059.00 $8,300.00 No Bid

7 $10,644.00 $11,775.00 No Bid

8 $3,414.00 $3,900.00 No Bid

9 $11,777.00 $28,860.00 No Bid

11 $6,407.00 $9,925.00 No Bid

12 $6,694.00 $10,355.00 No Bid

13 $8,341.00 $15,030.00 No Bid

14 $2,842.00 $3,880.00 No Bid

16 $8,316.00 $9,270.00 No Bid

17 $1,953.00 $2,570.00 No Bid

Total $71,736.00 $110,005.00 No Bid
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These trees do not exist and were deducted from the calculations for REMOVAL BY SERVICE ROUTE

SR 2 2021 W. Wiswall

SR 3 1303 S. Matthew

SR 5 1718 W. Smith

SR 9 1111 N. Orange 1604 N. Parkside 1611 W. Barker

SR 12 500 E. Maywood 2518 N. Knoxville


