VACANT LOT MOWING BID #16-14

UNIT PRICES
CONTRACTOR OPTION #1 OPTION #2 OPTION #3

Route 1 Route 2 Route 1 Route 2 Route 3
Hulse Lawncare No Bid No Bid $8.95 No Bid $9.95 $7.25
Wineinger & Sons $11.75 $12.50 $12.50 $12.50 $12.50 $12.50
JIMAX No Bid $24.00 $28.75 $24.00 $28.75 $18.67
Greenlee & Family No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,350.00 $1,150.00
Vale're No Bid $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00
Barrons No bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 $35.00 $40.00




Totals are to mow all vacant lots one cycle.

# of vacant lots unit price total Contractor
Option #1
County owned vacant lots 511 $11.75 $6,004.25 Wineinger
City owned vacant lots 160 $11.75 $1,880.00 Wineinger
Total Cost $7,884.25
Option #2
Route #1 Wineinger
County owned vacant lots 328 $12.50 $4,100.00
City owned vacant lots 77 $12.50 $962.50
Route #2
County owned vacant lots 183 $8.95 $1,637.85 Hulse
City owned vacant lots 83 $8.95 $742.85
Total Cost $7,443.20
Option #3
Route #1 Wineinger
County owned vacant lots 328 $12.50 $4,100.00
Route #2
County owned vacant lots 183 $9.95 $1,820.85 Hulse
Route #3
City owned vacant lots 160 $7.25 $1,160.00 Hulse

Total

$7,080.85




Option #3 If Hulse cannot do both Routes 2 & 3 and completes only Route 3

Route #1 Wineinger
County owned vacant lots 328 $12.50 $4,100.00

Route #2 Wineinger
County owned vacant lots 183 $12.50 $2,287.50

Route #3 Hulse
City owned vacant lots 160 $7.25 $1,160.00

Total $7,547.50

Option #3 If Hulse cannot do both Routes 2 & 3 and completes only Route 2

Route #1 Wineinger
County owned vacant lots 328 $12.50 $4,100.00

Route #2 Hulse
County owned vacant lots 183 $9.95 $1,820.85

Route #3 Wineinger
City owned vacant lots 160 $12.50 $2,000.00

Total $7,920.85

SUMMARY OF THE COST FOR ONE COMPLETE MOWING CYCLE
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