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llinois Department of Transportation

Office of Highways Project Implementation / Region 3 / District 4
401 Main Street / Peoria, lllinois 61602-1111

January 27, 2022

Ms. Stefanie Tarr, City Clerk
City of Peoria

419 Fulton Street, Suite 401
Peoria, lllinois 61602

Motor Fuel Tax (MFT) Funds

City of Peoria

Section No. 19-00029-00-EG

Improvement Resolution — Supplemental #1

Dear Ms. Ball:

The Supplemental Resolution for Improvement Under the lllinois Highway Code
(BLR 09110) adopted by the City Council of Peoria on December 14, 2021,
appropriating $96,200.00 of MFT funds for this section was approved on January
26, 2022.

This resolution provides for the reconstruction of West Glen Avenue from Sheridan
Road to IL Route 40 (North Knoxville Avenue) from a two-lane rural section to a
three-lane urban section.

*NOTE: Approval of this resolution does not authorize expenditure of MFT funds.
Proper documentation must be received by our office prior to paying any
bills out of the MFT account.

If you have any questions, please contact Mr. Simon Alwan at (309) 671-3694.

Sincerely,

R o e

Kensil A. Garnett, P.E.
Region Three Engineer

SJAJjjs
s:\gen\winword\blrs\staff\alwan\transmittals&letters\improv.resolutions\city of peoria 19400029-00-eg.supp res.docx
Attachment(s)

cc:  Ms. Andrea Klopfenstein, City Engineer
File



linois Department Resolution for Improvement
of Transportation Under the lllinois Highway Code
|s this project a bondable capital improvement? Resolution Type Resolution Number  Section Number
Yes []No Supplemental Al - 37% |[19-00029-00-EG
BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the City
Governing Body Type Local Public Agency Type
of Peoria lllinois that the following described street(s)/road(s)/structure be improved under

Name of Local Public Agency

the Illinois Highway Code. Work shall be done by Contract
Contract or Day Labor

For Roadway/Street Improvements:

Name of Street(s)/Road(s) (Ln‘iﬂgg)‘ Route From To
W Glen Avenue 0.48 FAU 6650 N Sheridan Road N Knoxville Ave (IL Rt 40)
For Structures:
Name of Street(s)/Road(s) Strigztrlggl'\lo Route Location Feature Crossed

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED,
1. That the proposed improvement shall consist of

Reconstruction of W Glen Ave from a two lane rural section to a three lane urban section.

2. That there is hereby appropriated the sum of Ninety six thousand two hundred dollars and zero cents
Dollars ( $96,200.00 ) for the improvement of

said section from the Local Public Agency's allotment of Motor Fuel Tax funds.
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Clerk is hereby directed to transmit four (4) certified originals of this resolution to the district office

of the Department of Transportation.

I, Stefanie S. Tarr City Clerk in and for said City
Name of Clerk Local Public Agency Type Local Public Agency Type

of Peoria in the State aforesaid, and keeper of the records and files thereof, as provided by
Name of Local Public Agency

statute, do hereby certify the foregoing to be a true, perfect and complete original of a resolution adopted by

Council of Peoria at a meeting held on ___‘,D\:l ‘4 I 2|

Governing Body Type Name of Local Public Agency R Date
IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and seal this 5 day of _) (SNVVV- D QO Z(L
" Day montn, vé'r
(SEAL) Clerk Signature Date i
,&ﬁ;)rgx\,u, damm [-5.2
U Approved 'L

Regional Engineer
Department of Transportation Date

(L

= A A—M‘ﬁw o1zIZZ

Printed 11/19/21 Page 1 of 1 BLR 09110 (Rev. 05/08/20)
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Mandz Moober:z

From: Stefanie Tarr

Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:36 AM

To: Mandy Mooberry; Michelle DeSutter; Courtney Coe; Vanessa
Altpeter

Subject: RE: MFT Resolution 21-373

Go ahead and change it to 1/5/22

From: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peoriagov.org>
Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:33 AM
To: Stefanie Tarr <starr@peoriagov.org>; Michelle DeSutter <mdesutter@peoriagov.org>; Courtney Coe

<ccoe@peoriagov.org>; Vanessa Altpeter <valtpeter@peoriagov.org>
Subject: RE: MFT Resolution 21-373

| will go ahead and fill in all of the dates but would you please send me an email stating that you mistakenly signed
1/5/21 instead of 1/5/22. | will attached it to the resolution and submit them to IDOT.

Thanks

Mandy Mooberry

Construction Program Manager

City of Peoria

Department of Public Works

Engineering

3505 N Dries Lane

Peoria, IL 61604

Phone: 309-494-8824 Cell: 309-208-0620

http://www.peoriagov.org/public-works/ (Department of Public Works} http://www.peoriapicksup.com/ (Yes, Peoria
Picks Up) https://peoriastormwater.com/ (Peoria’s Stormwater Utility)

From: Stefanie Tarr <starr@peoriagov.org>
Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:29 AM
To: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peoriagov.org>; Michelle DeSutter <mdesutter@peoriagov.org>; Courtney Coe

<ccoe@peoriagov.org>; Vanessa Altpeter <valtpeter@peoriagov.org>
Subject: RE: MFT Resolution 21-373

Hi Mandy. | reviewed past MFTs. I've attached a sample. They are all similar.
The MFT No. in the top box we do not fill in. The meeting date we generally do not fill in.
The signature date we generally type in.

However, we can all work together make sure they're complete.

Do you need us to type in my signature date?



----- Original Message--—--

From: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peariagov.org>

Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:05 AM

To: Michelle DeSutter <mdesutter@peoriagov.org>; Courtney Coe <ccoe@peoriagov.org>; Vanessa Altpeter
<valtpeter@peoriagov.org>

Cc: Stefanie Tarr <starr@peoriagov.org>

Subject: MFT Resolution 21-373

Hi everyone,

Please see that attached resolution. There are 3 locations that need information filled out. In the future when we send
resolutions, who should be filling these location out?

For now, can | complete this information on the originals | have to resubmit them to IDOT or would you like for me to
send them again for original signature and seal?

Thanks

Mandy Mooberry

Construction Program Manager

City of Peoria

Department of Public Works

Engineering

3505 N Dries Lane

Peoria, IL 61604

Phone: 309-494-8824 Cell: 309-208-0620

http://www.peoriagov.org/public-works/ (Department of Public Works) http://www.peoriapicksup.com/ (Yes, Peoria
Picks Up) https://peoriastormwater.com/ (Peoria’s Stormwater Utility)

From: pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org <pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org>
Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 10:39 AM

To: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peoriagov.org>

Subject: Scanned image from MX-4071

Reply to: pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org <pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org> Device Name: Not Set Device Model: MX-

4071
Location: Not Set

File Format: PDF (Medium)
Resolution: 200dpi x 200dpi

Attached file is scanned image in PDF format.
Use Acrobat(R)Reader(R) or Adobe(R)Reader(R) of Adobe Systems Incorporated to view the document.

Adobe(R)Reader(R) can be downloaded from the following URL:
Adobe, the Adobe logo, Acrobat, the Adobe PDF logo, and Reader are registered trademarks or trademarks of Adobe

Systems Incorporated in the United States and other countries.

http://www.adobe.com/



llinois Department Resolution for Improvement 3
of Transportation Under the lllinois Highway Code
Is this project a bondable capital improvement? Resolution Type Resolution Number  Section Number
Yes []No Supplemental || Al —27% |[19-00029-00-EG
BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the City
Governing Body Type Local Public Agency Type
of Peoria linois that the following described street(s)/road(s)/structure be improved under
Name of Local Public Agency
the lllinois Highway Code. Work shall be done by Contract
Contract or Day Labor
For Roadway/Street Improvements:
Name of Street(s)/Road(s) Lef‘g”‘ Route From To
(miles)
W Glen Avenue 0.48 FAU 6650 N Sheridan Road N Knoxville Ave (IL Rt 40)
For Structures:
Name of Street(s)/Road(s) Existing Route Location Feature Crossed
Structure No.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED,
1. That the proposed improvement shall consist of

Reconstruction of W Glen Ave from a two lane rural section to a three lane urban section.

2. That there is hereby appropriated the sum of Ninety six thousand two hundred dollars and zero cents
Dollars ( $96,200.00 ) for the improvement of

said section from the Local Public Agency's allotment of Motor Fuel Tax funds.
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Clerk is hereby directed to transmit four (4) certified originals of this resolution to the district office

of the Department of Transportation.

I, Stefanie S. Tarr City Clerk in and for said City
Name of Clerk Local Public Agency Type Local Public Agency Type

of Peoria in the State aforesaid, and keeper of the records and files thereof, as provided by
Name of Local Public Agency
statute, do hereby certify the foregoing to be a true, perfect and complete original of a resolution adopted by

Council of Peoria atameetingheldon | )_| 14 ’ 74,
Governing Body Type Name of Local Public Agency " Date
IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand and seal this 5 day of J ey 20227
" Day Month, ¥ear -
(SEAL) Clerk Signature Date

Mﬁf\/& \jm -5 »if}
) .

Approved

Regional Engineer
Department of Transportation Date

m olz7Zze

Printed 11/19/21 Page 1 of 1 BLR 09110 (Rev. 05/08/20)
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Mandx Moober:x

From: Stefanie Tarr

Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:36 AM

To: Mandy Mooberry; Michelle DeSutter; Courtney Coe; Vanessa
Altpeter

Subject: RE: MFT Resolution 21-373

Go ahead and change it to 1/5/22

From: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peoriagov.org>
Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:33 AM
To: Stefanie Tarr <starr@peoriagov.org>; Michelle DeSutter <mdesutter@peoriagov.org>; Courtney Coe

<ccoe@peoriagov.org>; Vanessa Altpeter <valtpeter@peoriagov.org>
Subject: RE: MFT Resolution 21-373

I will go ahead and fill in all of the dates but would you please send me an email stating that you mistakenly signed
1/5/21 instead of 1/5/22. | will attached it to the resolution and submit them to IDOT.

Thanks

Mandy Mocberry

Construction Program Manager

City of Peoria

Department of Public Works

Engineering

3505 N Dries Lane

Peoria, IL 61604

Phone: 309-494-8824 Cell: 309-208-0620

http://www.peoriagov.org/public-works/ (Department of Public Works) http://www.peoriapicksup.com/ (Yes, Peoria
Picks Up) https://peoriastormwater.com/ (Peoria’s Stormwater Utility)

From: Stefanie Tarr <starr@peoriagov.org>
Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:29 AM
To: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peoriagov.org>; Michelle DeSutter <mdesutter@peoriagov.org>; Courtney Coe

<ccoe@peoriagov.org>; Vanessa Altpeter <valtpeter@peoriagov.org>
Subject: RE: MFT Resolution 21-373

Hi Mandy. | reviewed past MFTs. I've attached a sample. They are all similar.
The MFT No. in the top box we do not fill in. The meeting date we generally do not fill in.
The signature date we generally type in.

However, we can all work together make sure they're complete.

Do you need us to type in my signature date?



.
¢

From: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peoriagov.org>
Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 11:05 AM
To: Michelle DeSutter <mdesutter@peoriagov.org>; Courtney Coe <ccoe@peoriagov.org>; Vanessa Altpeter

<valtpeter@peoriagov.org>
Cc: Stefanie Tarr <starr@peoriagov.org>
Subject: MFT Resolution 21-373

Hi everyone,

Please see that attached resolution. There are 3 locations that need information filled out. In the future when we send
resolutions, who should be filling these location out?

For now, can | complete this information on the originals [ have to resubmit them to IDOT or would you like for me to
send them again for original signature and seal?

Thanks

Mandy Mooberry

Construction Program Manager

City of Peoria

Department of Public Works

Engineering

3505 N Dries Lane

Peoria, IL 61604

Phone: 309-494-8824 Cell: 309-208-0620

http://www.peoriagov.org/public-works/ (Department of Public Works}) http://www.peoriapicksup.com/ (Yes, Peoria
Picks Up) https://peoriastormwater.com/ (Peoria’s Stormwater Utility)

From: pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org <pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org>
Sent: Friday, January 14, 2022 10:39 AM

To: Mandy Mooberry <mmooberry@peoriagov.org>

Subject: Scanned image from MX-4071

Reply to: pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org <pwp02.noreply@peoriagov.org> Device Name: Not Set Device Model: MX-

4071
Location: Not Set

File Format: PDF (Medium)
Resolution: 200dpi x 200dpi

Attached file is scanned image in PDF format.
Use Acrobat(R)Reader(R) or Adobe(R)Reader(R) of Adobe Systems Incorporated to view the document.

Adobe(R)Reader(R) can be downloaded from the following URL:
Adobe, the Adobe logo, Acrobat, the Adobe PDF logo, and Reader are registered trademarks or trademarks of Adobe

Systems Incorporated in the United States and other countries.

http://www.adobe.com/



