
Company Under 18" Over 19"to 30" Over 31"to 42" Over 43" Average Price

Durdel & Sons $325.00 $625.00 $925.00 $1,400.00 $818.75

Buskirk NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

K and P Tree $248.00 $525.00 Bid Withdrawn Bid Withdrawn 

Wilson Tree Service $250.00 $400.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,162.50

Affordable Tree Service $225.00 $550.00 $1,100.00 $1,500.00 $843.75

Andrews Tree Service $425.00 $855.00 $1,710.00 $2,280.00 $1,317.50

Ted Durdel Tree Service $292.00 $1,168.00 $1,752.00 $2,336.00 $1,387.00

Nels Johnson Tree NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Heartland Trucking NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 

Note:  K&P Tree Service and Affordable Tree Service later disbanded and two of the owners merged as A Cut Above Tree Service
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