
ORDINANCE 17.404

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 5 OF THE CODE OF THE CITY OF PEORIA
PERTAINING TO AMENDMENTS TO INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODES.

WHEREAS, the City of Peoria, Illinois is a home rule municipality pursuant to Article VII,
Section 6 of the Illinois Constitution of 1970; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the City Council of the City of Peoria, Illinois
as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 5 of the Code of the City of Peoria is hereby amended by deleting
the following stricken words and by adding the following underlined words:

Sec. 5-121. Compliance with International Building Code required.

The International Building Code/20002012 is hereby adopted by reference.

Sec. 5-122. Amendments to International Building Code.

The International Building Code, as adopted in section 5 121 of this chapter, is
amended as provided in this section.

Section 101.1, Title, is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 101.1, TitJe.These regulations shall be knO't\'nas the BuildingCode of the City
of Peoria, hereinafter referred to as this code.

Section 101.4.1, 5Jectrica.~is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 101.4.1, Electrical. The provisions of the currently adopted National Electrical
Code shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, repairs,
replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto.

Section 101.4.4, PliJmbing, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 101.4.4, Plumbing. The provisions of the currently adopted State of Illinois
Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair and replacement of
plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and
appurtenances, and 'Nhereconnected to a water or sewage system.

Section 112,Means ofAppea!, is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 112.1, Construction Commf.ssion.The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the construction commission as established in Article II of
Chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code, from any decision of the code official as set forth
in Section 5 61 of the Peoria City Code.

Section 112.2, Limitations on authority, is hereby amended to read as follo'NS:
Section 112.2, Limitations on authorIty.An application for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally good



ORDINANCE 17,404

or better form of construction is proposed. The board shall have no authority to waive
requirements of this code.

Section 112.3,QuaJffications, is hereby amended to read as follo'lls:
Section 112.3,Qualifications. The Construction Commission shall consist of members
who are qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building
construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction.

Section 113.4, Violation penalties, shall read as follows:
Section 113.4, VioJation penalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or
fails to comply 'Nithany other requirements thereof or 'Nhoerects, constructs, alters or
repairs a building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the building official, or a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of
this code, shall be guilty of a violation punishable by a fine or not more than $500.00.
Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 114.2, Issuance, shall read as follows:
Section 114.2, Issuance. The stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to
the owner of the property involved or to the owner's agent or to the person doing the
work. Upon issuance of the stop 'Nork order, the cited work shall immediately cease.
The stop work order shall state the reason for the order, and the conditions under
which the cited work '....ill be permitted to resume. The 'Nork order shall conform to
Section 5 80 of the Peoria City Code.

Section 114.3, UnJa'lRul continuance, shall read as follows:
Section 114.3, UniavRul continuance. Any person who shall continue any work after
having been servedwith a stop 'Norkorder, except suchwork as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be subject to a fine of not
less than $25,00 or more than $500.00.

Section 109.3. Stair treads and risers, shall read as follows:
Section 109.3 Stair treads and risers, Exception No.5. In occupancies in Group R 3
as applicable in Section 101.2 within dwelling units in occupancies in Group R 2, as
applicable in Section 101.2 and in occupancies in Group U,which are accessory to an
occupancy in Group R 3, as applicable in Section 101.2, the maximum riser heights
shall be 8% inches (210 mm) and the minimum tread depth shall be nine inches (229
mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm) but not more than 1.25 inches (32
mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers 'Nherethe tread depth is less than
11 inches (279 mm).

Chapter 11.Accessib#ity is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following inserted in
lieu thereof:

The provisions of the Illinois Accessibility Code shall control the design and
construction of faoilities for aooessibility to physically disabled persons. Buildings and
facilities shall be designed and constructed to be accessible in accordance '.vith the
Illinois Accessibility Code.

Chapter 27, EJectrtcaJ Systems, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following
inserted in lieu thereof:



ORDINANCE 17,404

Chapter 27, EkJctrical System. The current National Electrical Code adopted by the
City of Peoria shall be followed for all design and installation of electrical systems,
alterations, repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and
appurtenances thereto.

Chapter 29, Plumbing Sy-stems, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following
inserted in lieu thereof:

Chapter 29, PJ-umbingSystems. The current State of Illinois Plumbing Code shall be
followed for all design and installation of plumbing systems, including sanitary and
storm drainage, sanitary facilities, '.vatersupply and storm'J'laterand sevt'agedisposal
in buildings.

The International Building Code. as adopted in section 5-121 of this chapter. is
amended as provided in this section.

Section 101.1. Title. is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 101.1. Title.These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City
of Peoria. hereinafter referred to as this code.

Section 101.4.1. Electrical. is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 101.4.1.Electrical. The provisions of the currently adopted National Electrical
Code shall apply to the installation of electrical systems. including alterations. repairs.
replacement. equipment. appliances. fixtures. fittings and appurtenances thereto.

Section 101.4.4. Plumbing. is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 101.4.4. Plumbing. The provisions of the currently adopted State of Illinois
Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation. alteration. repair and replacement of
plumbing systems. including equipment. appliances. fixtures. fittings and
appurtenances. and where connected to a water or sewage system.

Section 112.Means of Appeal. is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 112.1.Construction Commission. The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the construction commission as established in Article II of
Chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code. from any decision of the code official as set forth
in Section 5-61 of the Peoria City Code.

Section 112.2. Limitations on authority. is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 112.2. Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted. the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally good
or better form of construction is proposed. The board shall have no authority to waive
requirements of this code.

Section 112.3.Qualifications. is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 112.3.Qualifications.The Construction Commission shall consist of members
who are qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building
construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction.

Section 113.4. Violationpenalties. shall read as follows:



ORDINANCE 17,404

Section 113.4, Violationpenalties. Any person who violates a provision of this code or
fails to comply with any other requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or
repairs a building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the building official. or a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of
this code, shall be guilty of a violation punishable by a fine or not more than $500.00.
Each day that a violation continues shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 114.2, Issuance, shall read as follows:
Section 114.2, Issuance. The stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to
the owner of the property involved or to the owner's agent or to the person doing the
work. Upon issuance of the stop work order, the cited work shall immediately cease.
The stop work order shall state the reason for the order, and the conditions under
which the cited work will be permitted to resume. The work order shall conform to
Section 5-80 of the Peoria City Code.

Section 114.3,Unlawful continuance, shall read as follows:
Section 114.3, Unlawful continuance. Any person who shall continue any work after
having been servedwith a stopwork order, except such work as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe conditions, shall be subject to a fine of not
less than $25.00 or more than $500.00.

Section 109.3. Stair treads and risers, shall read as follows:

Section 109.3 Stair treads and risers, Exception No.5. In occupancies in Group R-3
as applicable in Section 101.2 within dwelling units in occupancies in Group R-2, as
applicable in Section 101.2 and in occupancies in Group U,which are accessorv to an
occupancy in Group R-3, as applicable in Section 101.2, the maximum riser heights
shall be 8X inches (210 mm) and the minimum tread depth shall be nine inches (229
mm). A nosing not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm) but not more than 1.25 inches (32
mm) shall be provided on stairways with solid risers where the tread depth is less than
11 inches (279 mm).

Chapter 11.Accessibilitv is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following inserted in
lieu thereof:

The provisions of the Illinois Accessibility Code shall control the design and
construction of facilities for accessibility to physically disabled persons. Buildings and
facilities shall be designed and constructed to be accessible in accordance with the
Illinois Accessibility Code.

Chapter 27, Electrical Systems, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following
inserted in lieu thereof:

Chapter 27, Electrical System. The current National Electrical Code adopted by the
City of Peoria shall be followed for all design and installation of electrical systems,
alterations, repairs, replacement. equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and
appurtenances thereto.

Chapter 29, Plumbing Systems, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following
inserted in lieu thereof:

Chapter 29, Plumbing Systems. The current State of Illinois Plumbing Code shall be
followed for all design and installation of plumbing systems, including sanitary and



ORDINANCE 17,404

storm drainage, sanitary facilities, water supply and stormwater and sewage disposal
in buildings.

The city clerk shall keep one copy of such code on file in her office and make the same
available for inspection or copying pursuant to office policy.

Sec. 5-123. Compliance with the International Residential Code for One- and
Two-Family Dwellings/20062012 is required.

The One- and Two-Family Dwelling Code, 2GOO2012 Edition of the International
Residential Code is hereby adopted by reference.

Sec. 5-124. Amendments to the International Residential Code.

The International Residential Code, as adopted in Section 5 123 is amended as
provided in this section.

SeotioR R101.1 TWe, shall read as follows:
SeotioR R101.1. Title. These regulations shall be kno'Nnas the Residential Code for
One and Two Family Dwelling of the City of Peoria and shall be cited as such and will
be referred to herein as "this code."

SeotioR R102.5. AppeRdioes, shall read as follows:
SeotioR R102.5. AppeRd/oes. AppeRd/x G. Swimming Pools, Spas and hot tubs is
hereby adopted as part of the City of Peoria's Code.

SeotioR R112. Board of Appeals is hereby amended to read as follows:
SeotioR 112.1. CORstruot/oR CommissioR. The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the construction commission as established in Article II of
Chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code, from any decision of the code official as set forth
in section 5 61 of the Peoria City Code.

SeotioR 112.2UmitatioRs ORauthority, is hereby amended to read as follows:
SeotioR 112.2 Lim/tatioRs ORauthority. An Application for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally good
or better form of construction is proposed. The board shall have no authority to waive
requirements of this code.

SeotioR 112.2.1,DeterminatioR ofsubstaRtiafimprc)'IemeRtiR areas proRe to floodiRg
is hereby deleted.

SeotioR 112.3,QualifioatioRs, is hereby added to read as follm...s:
SeotioR 112.3,QualifioatioRs. The Construction Commission shall consist of members
who are qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building
construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction.

SeotioR R112.3, Qual/fioatioRs is hereby deleted.
SeotioR R112.4, AdmiRistratioR is hereby deleted. SeotioR R 301.2 TabkJ R301.2(1).

Climatio oriteria, shall read as follows: SeotioR R301.2. Table R301.2(1). Climatio aRd
Geographio DesigR oriteria.



ORDINANCE 17,404

I
GrOl::lR9SROI,t.!IOa9

I
2G J')sf P€J

WiR9 SJ')ee9 (FRJ')I=I) 9G FRJ')I=I

SeisFRiG (;)esi€JRGate€JoFy B

I
Weatl=leriR€J

I
Severe

I=rost liRe geJ')tl=l JeiRGl=les

+erFRite M0gerate to l=IealJy

(;)eGay Sli€Jl=ltto FR0gerate

WiRter gesi€JR temJ')eratl::lre 1G ge€Jrees

-

I
IGe earrier I::IRgeriaymeRt reEll::lire9 ¥es

1=1009l=Ia~ar9s (a) MarGI=I2G, 1979

I I
(e) l=eerl::laFy 1, 199G

I
Air free~iR€J iRgex ;:.1§GG 2GGG

MeaR aRRl::lal teFRJ') W

SeatteR 311.5.3, nea9s aR9 risers, sl=lall rea9 as follows:

R311.5.3.1 Riser height. +l=Ie FRaximl::lm riser l=Ieigl=ltsl=lall ee R2§ iRGl=les.+l=Ie riser
sl=lall ee FReaSl::lre9 vertiaally eetweeR lea9iR€J e9€Jes of tl=le a9jaGeRt trea9s. +l=Ie
€Jreatest riser l=Iei€Jl=lt'Nitl=liR aRY fli€Jl=ltof stair sl=lall Rot eXGee9 tl=le sFRaliest ey FRore
tl=laR JIg iRGI=I.

R311.5.3.2 Tread depth. +l=Ie FRiRiFRI::IFRtrea9 geJ')tl=lsl=lall ee 9 iRGl=les.tl=le trea9 geJ')tl=l
sl=lall ee FReaSl::lre9 l=Iori~oRtally eetweeR tl=le vertiGal J')laRes of tl=le foremost J')FOjeGtioR
of a9jaGeRt trea9s aR9 at a ri€Jl=ltaR€Jle to tl=le trea9'S lea9iR€J e9€Je. +l=Ie €Jreatest trea9
geJ')tl=lwitl=liR aRY fli€Jl=ltof stairs sl=lall Rot eXGee9 tl=le sFRaliest ey FRore tl=laR Jig iRGI=I.
VViRger trea9S sl=lall l=Iave a FRiRiml::lmtrea9 geJ')tl=lof 9 iRGl=lesFReaSl::lre9as aeove at a
J')OiRt12 iRGl=lesfroFR tl=lesige wl=lere tl=le trea9s are RarFOwer. V'IiRger trea9s sl=lall l=Iave
a FRiRiFRI::IFRtrea9 geJ')tl=lof e iRGl=lesat aRY J')OiRt.'l'litl=liR aRY fli€Jl=ltof stairs, tl=le€Jreatest
wiRger trea9 geJ')tl=lat tl=le 12 iRGI=Iwalk liRe sl=lall Rot eXGee9 tl=lesFRaliest ey more tl=laR
Jig iRGI=I.

-------------- - - -_.



ORDINANCE 17,404

S t; M13076 Drotection of equipment the following section is hereby added.ec.on ~ . ,.4
. I d· b ment orSection M1307.6, Pmtection of equipment: All equipment p a~e In a ;ase ~ d

similar location that would be subject to dampness shall be raised a~d.or pr?t~c e
from damage by a minimum one inch high concrete base, one Inch r:'IAImUm
galvanized steel support frame, or similar method approved by the code offiCial.

Part 'ifl Pf.umbing:Chapters 25 through 32, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
following inserted in lieu thereof:

The current State of Illinois Plumbing Code s~all be followed for .all design .an~
installation of plumbing systems, including sanlta,!, and s.torm.d~alnage, saAltar~
facilities, water supply and stormwater and sewage disposal In bUildings.

The city clerk shall keep one copy of such cod~ on fil~ in her office and make the same
available for inspection or copying pursuant to office policy.

Residential Code/2006, TableChapter 11 Energy Conservation, International
N1102.1, is amended to read as follows:

Table N1102.1
INSUlATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENP..

G I
8 Ib
A !i

F A
S I

I
s IE z

E I~N E
M I~

()E
EJ -bS • NT ~
Tj (;

ER
I;.,

NA
'I l E ITI b \A

I
0 g

A IN T
b It.

R I,I
b'I - A IY-

iJj ~ TI

I
i F

~ R-I A G --I (;
N Ic

l V IT (; A I0 S
b i~R W
YG
EC

I,I



ORDINANCE 17,404

I
4-01

i
G-:!. I .,.

I Qi2 +1 4() I

I
!

aj I I I I I
I I I II I

! I

:1

Q

G-:I I I I
01 IG-: .,. I Ii I I+a +1 4()1 I

I
I I I

I

I
i I

!I
al

I
I I I Ii I I I I

QI - I
I

I I I IG-: .,.1 G-:I I4()1 I QII I Iea e I 1e

I I

I
Ii a

I I II I I I
I

" 1

I I I I
I

I I I
<!

I I I
I

, ! I Ii :I

I
I I! i

I I
II .1

II II

I '1 I 41 I

I I I

I I Ijl I Q I QI Ij I wiI

I
I
II : G-:1 .,.

t I Ii 4()i e Ri
1 I I

I

I 4!
II Q II

I

J i Id I II I i I, I
I

ii Ii

I
II I I
I

, L

I

i

I1 ~I
I I

I

.j I I
II I jI 1-«~

;1
II

;1

I

I~.
I.1

I I
I I Q

I
G-:i .,. WI

, Jai e Rj
II I

QI II i I~I I

~I I I
I I

·1 I II

'I II

l=I

I

I



ORDINANCE 17,404

I 4-G
QQ,. 7 N

I tI
J5 s R

4-G
~

I

4-G
Qi

Q,. N7

t~
RJ5 €i

4-,
G

~

a R values are minimums. U factors and SHGC are maximums. R 19 insulation shall
be permitted to be compressed into a 2 x €i cavity.

I
;=::::::~i::=:=:::~~ht. +he solar heat ~ain coefficient

G +he firs R Iialue applies to continuous insulation, the second to framin~ cavity
insulation; either insulation meets the reEluirements.

a R a shall be added to the reEluiredslab ed~e R values for heated slabs.
I

I
e +here are no solar heat ~ain coefficient ~SHGC)reEluirementsin the Marine lone.

f Or insulation sufficient to fill the framin~ cavity, R 19 minimum.
I

9 "1J"'a" means R 1J callity insulation plus R a insulated sheathin~. If structural
sheathin~ covers 2a% or less of the exterior, R a sheathin~ is not reEluiredwhere
structural sheathin~ is used. If structural sheathin~ COllersmore than 2a% of e~derior,
structural sheathin~ shall be supplemented '.\lithinsulated sheathin~ of at least R 2.

R ReEluiredat time basement space is converted to habitable space.

The International Residential Code, as adopted in Section 5-123 is amended as
provided in this section.



ORDINANCE 17,404

Section R101.1 Title, shall read as follows:

Section R101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known as the Residential Code for
One- and Two-Family Dwelling of the City of Peoria and shall be cited as such and will
be referred to herein as "this code. "

Section R102.5. Appendices, shall read as follows:

Section R102.5. Appendices. Appendix G. Swimming Pools, Spas and hot tubs is
hereby adopted as part of the City of Peoria's Code.

Section R112. Board of Appeals is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 112.1. Construction Commission. The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the construction commission as established in Article II of
Chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code, from any decision of the code official as set forth
in section 5-61 of the Peoria City Code.

Section 112.2 Limitations on authoritv, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 112.2 Limitations on authority. An Application for appeal shall be based on a
claim that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply or an equally good
or better form of construction is proposed. The board shall have no authority to waive
requirements of this code.

Section 112.2. 1, Determination of substantial improvement in areas prone to flooding
is hereby deleted.

Section 112.3, Qualifications, is hereby added to read as follows:

Section 112.3, Qualifications.The Construction Commission shall consist of members
who are qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to building
construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction.

Section R112.3, Qualifications is hereby deleted.

Section R112.4, Administration is hereby deleted.

Section 311.5.3, Treads and risers, shall read as follows:

R311.5.3.1 Riser height. The maximum riser height shall be 8.25 inches. The riser
shall be measured vertically between leading edges of the adjacent treads. The
greatest riser height within any flight of stair shall not exceed the smallest by more
than 3/8 inch.

R311.5.3.2 Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches. the tread depth
shall be measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection
of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread's leading edge. The greatest tread
depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch.
Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 9 inches measured as above at a
point 12 inches from the side where the treads are narrower. Winder treads shall have
a minimum tread depth of 6 inches at any point. Within any flight of stairs, the greatest
winder tread depth at the 12 inch walk line shall not exceed the smallest by more than
3/8 inch.

Section M1307.6, Protection of equipment is hereby added.



ORDINANCE 17,404

Section M1307.6, Protection of equipment: All equipment placed in a basement or
similar location that would be subject to dampness shall be raised and/or protected
from damage by a minimum one-inch high concrete base, one-inch minimum
galvanized steel support frame, or similar method approved by the code official.

Section R313.1 shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section R313.2 shall be deleted in its entirety.
Part VII Plumbing: Chapters 25 through 32, is hereby deleted in its entirety and the

following inserted in lieu thereof:
The current State of Illinois Plumbing Code shall be followed for all design and
installation of plumbing systems, including sanitary and storm drainage, sanitary
facilities, water supply and stormwater and sewage disposal in buildings.

Sec. 5-125. 20032012International Property Maintenance Code adopted.

(a) The 2GW2012 International Property Maintenance Code as published by the
International Code Council, Inc. is hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance Code of
the City of Peoria.

(b) Where no specific standards to the contrary are prescribed by this chapter,
conformity is requiredwith and pursuant to "2GW2012 International Property Maintenance
Code," as amended along with all codes and standards referred to therein.
Sec. 5-126. Amendments to the 20032012International Property Maintenance

Code.

The 2003 International Property Maintenance Code as adopted in section 5 125, is
amended as follows:

(1) Section 101.1, Title, is amended to read as follows:
101.1 "Title." This article shall be kno'Nnas the Property Maintenance Code of
the City of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

(2) Sections 103.1, 103.2, 103.3 and 103.5 are deleted in their entirety.

(3) Section 104.1, Genera/, shall read:
This code official shall enforce all of the provisions of this code except the Fire
Marshal or his designee shall enforce Section 704.0 FIRE PROTECTION
SYSTEMS.

(4) Section 106.3, p.rosecutionofvio/ation, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(5) Section 106.4, 'Iiolation penalties, is hereby amended to read as follows:

106.4,Violation penalties.Any personwho shall violate a provision of this code
or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof shall, upon
conviction thereof, be subject to a fine of not more than $500.00. Each day that
a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a
separate offense.

(6) Section 107.5, Transfer of ollll1ershfp,is hereby amended to read as follo...t's:



ORDINANCE 17,404

107.5 Transfer of ownership: It shall be unla'Nfulfor the owner of any dwelling
unit or structure 'Nhohas received a compliance order or upon whom a notice
of violation has been served to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or othelV/ise
dispose of such dwelling unit or structure to another until the provision of the
compliance order or notice of violation have been complied with, or until such
owner shall first furnish the grantee, transferee, or lessee a true copy of any
compliance order or notice of violation issued by the code official and shall
furnish to the code official a signed and notarized statement from the grantee,
transferee, or lessee, acknowledging the receipt of such compliance order or
notice of violation and fully accepting the responsibility with condition for
making the corrections or repairs required by such compliance order or notice
of violation. This requirement shall not preclude any person from seeking a
variance or an appeal pursuant to the other sections of this code.

(7) Seotion 110.0, Demotition, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(8) Seotion 111.0,Means ofAppeaJ, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(9) Seotion 201.3 Terms defined in other oodes shall read as follows:

201.3 Terms as defined in other codes: Where terms are not defined in this
code and are defined in the International Building Code, International Fire
Code, International Zoning Code, State of Illinois Plumbing Code, International
Mechanical Code, International Existing Building code or the National Electric
Code, such terms shall have the meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.

(10) Seotion 202, General Definitions, Habitable spaoe, shall read:
Habitable space: Space in a residential structure for living, sleeping, eating or
cooking. Bathrooms, toilet rooms, closets, halls, storage or utility spaces, and
similar areas are not considered habitable spaces

(11) Seotion 301.2, Responsibility, shall read:
Responsibility. The Owner of the premises shall maintain the structures and
exterior property in compliance '....ith these requirements, except as otherwise
provided for in Sections 307.0 and 308.0 and in sections 13 37 and 13 39 of
the Property Maintenance Code of the City of Peoria.

(12) Seotion 302.1, Sanitation, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(13) Seotion 302.7, Aooessory Struotl:Jres,shall read:

Accessory Structures. All accessory structures, including detached garages,
fences and .....alls, shall be maintained structurally sound and in good repair.
They shall be free of insects and rodents. The exterior of each accessory
structure shall be weather resistant. All fences on the premises shall be
constructed of manufactured metal fencing material, wood, masonry, or other
inert material. Such fences shall be maintained by the owner. Wood materials
shall be protected against decay. VVhereverany required egress door\flay from
a building opens into a fenced area, there shall be a means of entrance and
exit from the premises to the nearest public way.

(14) Seotion 304.5, Foundation, V'lal!s,shall read:



ORDINANCE 17,404

FoundationWalls. All foundation 'Nallsshall bemaintained structurally safe and
sound and free from open cracks and breaks in such a condition so as to
prevent the entry of rodents.

(15) Section 304.12, Handra#sand gl:Jarcis,shall read:
Except in single family residential dwellings built prior to 1972, every exte~ior
and interior flight of stairs having more than four risers, and every open portion
of a stair landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface which is
more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below shall have
guards. Handrails shall not be less than 30 inches (762 mm) nor more than 42
inches (1067 mm) high, measured vertically above the nosing of the tread or
above the finished floor of the landing or walking surfaces. Guards shall not be
less than 30 inches (762 mm) high above the floor of the landing, balcony,
porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface. Every handrail and guard shall be
firmly fastened and capable of supporting normally imposed loads and shall be
maintained in good condition.

(16) Section 501.1.2, Pil:Jmbing,shall read:
Plumbing.Where any conflict exists between the Illinois State Plumbing Code
and Property Maintenance Code the more stringent shall apply.

(17) Section 602.4, Occupjable Vlorkspaces, shall read:
Occupiable lJlorkspaces: Indoor occupiablework spaces shall be suppliedwith
heat during the period from September 15th to May 15th to maintain a
temperature of not less than 65 degrees (18 degrees C.) during the period the
spaces are occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special
temperature conditions.
2. Areas in 'Nhich persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical
activities.
3. Warehousing or similar facilities.

(18) Section 604.2 Seplice shall read as follo'Ns:
604.2 Service: The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve
as a basis for determining the need for additional facilities in accordance with
the National Electrical Code. Dwelling units shall be served by a three '....ire,
120/240 volt, single phase electrical service having a rating of not less than 60
amperes.

(19) Section 704.1.1 Enforcement, shall read:
The Fire Marshall or his designee shall enforce all of the provisions of Section
704.0 FIRE PREVENTION SYSTEMS in accordance with Chapter 11 of the
Peoria City Code.



ORDINANCE 17,404

(20) Article 16, sections 16.9, 16.10, and 16.11 of the Zoning Ordinance, Appendix
B of the Code of the City of Peoria pertaining to screening are hereby
incorporated into the Property Maintenance Code.

(21) Article 17, sections 17.10 and 17.15 of the Zoning Ordinance, Appendix B of
the Code of the City of Peoria pertaining to signage are hereby incorporated in
their entirety into the Property Maintenance Code.

The 2012 International Property Maintenance Code as adopted in section 5-125, is
amended as follows:

Section 101.1, Title, is amended to read as follows:
101.1 "Title."This article shall be known as the Property MaintenanceCode of the City

of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Sections 103.1, 103.2, 103.3 and 103.5are deleted in their entirety.
Section 104.1, General, shall read:
This code official shall enforce all of the provisions of this code except the Fire Marshal
or his designee shall enforce Section 704.0 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS.

Section 106.3, Prosecution of violation, shall be deleted in its entirety.

Section 106.4, Violationpenalties, is hereby amended to read as follows:
106.4, Violationpenalties.Any personwho shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof shall, upon conviction thereof, be
subject to a fine of not more than $500.00. Each day that a violation continues after
due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 107.5, Transfer of ownership, is hereby amended to read as follows:
107.5 Transfer of ownership: It shall be unlawful for the owner of any dwelling unit or
structure who has received a compliance order or upon whom a notice of violation has
been served to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise dispose of such dwelling
unit or structure to another until the provision of the compliance order or notice of
violation have been complied with, or until such owner shall first furnish the grantee,
transferee, or lessee a true copy of any compliance order or notice of violation issued
by the code official and shall furnish to the code official a signed and notarized
statement from the grantee, transferee, or lessee, acknowledging the receipt of such
compliance order or notice of violation and fully accepting the responsibility with
condition for making the corrections or repairs required by such compliance order or
notice of violation. This requirement shall not preclude any person from seeking a
variance or an appeal pursuant to the other sections of this code.

Section 110.0, Demolition, shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section 111.0,Means of Appeal, shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section 201.3 Termsdefined in other codes shall read as follows:
201.3 Terms as defined in other codes: Where terms are not defined in this code and
are defined in the International Building Code, International Fire Code, International
Zoning Code, State of Illinois Plumbing Code, International Mechanical Code,



ORDINANCE 17,404

International Existing Building code or the National Electric Code, such terms shall
have the meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.

Section 301.2, Responsibility, shall read:
Responsibility. The Owner of the premises shall maintain the structures and exterior
property in compliance with these requirements, except as otherwise provided for in
Sections 307.0 and 308.0 and in sections 13-37 and 13-39 of the Property
Maintenance Code of the City of Peoria.

Section 302.1, Sanitation, shall be deleted in its entirety.

Section 302.7, Accessory Structures, shall read:
Accessory Structures. All accessory structures, including detached garages, fences
andwalls, shall be maintained structurally sound and in good repair. They shall be free
of insects and rodents. The exterior of each accessory structure shall be weather
resistant. All fences on the premises shall be constructed of manufactured metal
fencing material, wood, masonry, or other inert material. Such fences shall be
maintained by the owner. Wood materials shall be protected against decay. Wherever
any required egress doorway from a building opens into a fenced area, there shall be
a means of entrance and exit from the premises to the nearest public way.

Section 304.5, Foundation, Walls, shall read:
Foundation Walls.All foundation walls shall be maintained structurally safe and sound
and free from open cracks and breaks in such a condition so as to prevent the entry
of rodents.

Section 304.12, Handrails and guards, shall read:
Except in single-family residential dwellings built prior to 1972, every exterior and
interior flight of stairs having more than four risers, and every open portion of a stair
landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface which is more than 30
inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below shall have guards. Handrails shall not
be less than 30 inches (762 mm) nor more than 42 inches (1067 mm) high, measured
vertically above the nosing of the tread or above the finished floor of the landing or
walking surfaces. Guards shall not be less than 30 inches (762 mm) high above the
floor of the landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface. Every
handrail and guard shall be firmly fastened and capable of supporting normally
imposed loads and shall be maintained in good condition.

Section 304.14 Insect Screens, shall read:

Insect Screens.During the period from April 15 to October 15, every door, window and
other outside opening utilized or required for ventilation purposes servings any
structure containing habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas, or
any areas where products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption
are processed, manufactured, packaged, or stored, shall be supplied with approved
tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh per inch and every swinging door shall
have a self-closing device in good working condition. Exception: screen doors shall
not be required where other approved means, such as air curtains or insect repellant
fans are employed.

Section 404.5, OvercroWding,shall read:



ORDINANCE 17,404

Overcrowding: Dwelling units shall not be occupied by more occupants than permitted
by the minimum area requirements of Table 404.5.

Compliance with this section is not a defense to a violation of section 5-271 of the
Housing Property Maintenance Code or section 7.7 and Article 18 of the Zoning
Ordinance.

Section 501.1.2, Plumbing, shall read:
Plumbing. Where any conflict exists between the Illinois State Plumbing Code and
Property Maintenance Code the more stringent shall apply.

Section 505.1 General, shall read as follows:
505.1 General: Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking fountain, water closet.
or other plumbing fixture shall be properly connected to either a public water system
or to an approved private water system. All kitchen sinks, lavatories, laundry facilities,
bathtubs and showers shall be supplied with hot or tempered and cold running water
in accordance with the State of Illinois Plumbing Code.

Section 602.2 Residential occupancies, shall read:
Residential occupancies. Every dwelling shall be provided with heating facilities
capable of maintaining a room temperature of 65 degrees F. at a distance of 18 inches
above floor level to an outdoor temperature of minus 10 degrees F. in all habitable
rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms based on the outside design temperature required
for the locality by the mechanical code listed in chapter 8.

Section 602.3 Heat Supply. shall read:
Heat Supply. Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one
or more dwelling units, rooming unit. dormitory or guestroom on terms either
expressed or implied, to furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall supply sufficient
heat during the period from September 15to May 15 to maintain the room temperature
specified in Section 602.2 during the hours between 8:30 a.m. and 10:30 p.m. of each
day and not less than 60 degrees F. during other hours.

Section 602.4, Occupiable work spaces, shall read:

Occupiable work spaces: Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat
during the period from September 15th to May 15th to maintain a temperature of not
less than 65 degrees (18 degrees C.) during the period the spaces are occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special
temperature conditions.

2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical activities.
3. Warehousing or similar facilities.
Section 604.2, Service shall read as follows:

604.2 Service:The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve as a basis
for determining the need for additional facilities in accordance with the National



ORDINANCE 17,404

Electrical Code. Dwelling units shall be served by a three-wire, 120/240 volt, single­
phase electrical service having a rating of not less than 60 amperes.

Section 704.1.1 Enforcement, shall read:
The Fire Marshall or his designee shall enforce all of the provisions of Section 704.0
FIRE PREVENTION SYSTEMS in accordance with Chapter 11 of the Peoria City
Code

Section 702.4 Emergency Escape Openings, shall read:
Emergency Escape Openings. Every sleeping room located in a basement in an
occupancy in Use Group 1-1or R shall have at least one openable window or exterior
door approved for emergency egress or rescue; or shall have access not less than two
approved independent exits. All required outside windows and doors, when designed
to be operable, shall be operable from the inside without the use of tools and shall
meet the following requirements:

(a) if built prior to 1972, subject to the 1985 Life Safety Code 101;

(b) if built after 1972, subject to the Building Code in effect for that year.

Section 101.1 Title, shall read:
101.1 "Title"This regulation article shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code
of the City of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Section 202.0, Definitions; Rubbish, shall read as follows:
Rubbish: Combustible and noncombustiblewaste materials, except garbage; the term
shall include the residue from the burning of wood, coal, coke and other combustible
materials, paper, rags, cartons, boxes, household furniture such as sofas, stuffed
chairs and mattresses when found on the exterior of the property, wood, excelsior,
rubber, leather, tree branches, yard trimmings, tin cans, metals, mineral matter, glass,
crockery and dust and other similar materials.

Section 301.2, Responsibility, shall read:
"Responsibility"The Owner of the premises shall maintain the structures and exterior
property in compliance with these requirements, except as otherwise provided for in
Section 307.0 and 308.0 and in Sections 13-37and 13-39of the Property Maintenance
Code of the City of Peoria.

Section 302.1 Sanitation, shall be deleted in its entirety.

Section 302.5 Rodent Harborage, shall read as follows:
"RodentHarborage."All structures and exterior property shall be kept free from rodent
harborage and infestation. All exterior wood, construction materials or other stored
items shall be stored in a rodent proof manner such as elevating the materials 12
inches above the earth, enclosing the materials in rodent proof containers, utilizing an
extermination process or other approved methods. The Code Official may request
verification that the property has been baited. Where rats are found, they shall be
properly exterminated by approved processes, which will not be injurious to human
health. After extermination, proper precautions shall be taken to eliminate rodent
harborage and prevent reinfestation.



ORDINANCE 17,404

Section 308.1 Accumulation of rubbish and garbage, shall read as follows:
"Accumulation of rubbish and garbage." All exterior property and premises, and the
interior of every structure shall be free from any accumulation of rubbish and garbage.
The owner and/or occupant of a single-family structure shall have the responsibility to
maintain the premises free from litter.

Section 308.2.1 Rubbish Storage Facilities, shall read as follows:
"Rubbish Storage Facilities." The owner of every two-family and multiple-family
premises shall supply approved covered containers for rubbish, and the owner of the
premises shall be responsible for the removal of rubbish.

Section 308.3.1 Garbage Facilities, shall read as follows:
"Garbage Facilities."The owner of every two-family and multiple family dwelling shall
supply one of the following: an approved mechanical waste grinder in each dwelling
unit; an approved incinerator unit in the structure available to the occupants in each
dwelling unit or an approved leakproof, covered, outside garbage container.

Section 202.0, General Definitions, Obsolete Signs, shall read as follows:
Any sign including the sign structure, retractable canopy or awning, which advertises
a business no longer being conducted or a product no longer being sold in or from the
premises to which the sign relates is considered obsolete. Signs left in good repair
which remove all aspects of former business and present a solid color blank slate are
not considered obsolete.
Section 304.2 Protective treatment, shall read as follows:
All exterior surfaces, including but not limited to, doors, door and window frames,
exterior signs, cornices, porches, trim, balconies, decks and fences, shall be
maintained in good condition. Obsolete signs are prohibited and considered not to be
in good condition. Exterior signs not being maintained include but is not limited to
exposed wires, peeling paint, damaged surfaces and missing components. Exterior
wood surfaces, other than decay-resistant woods, shall be protected from the
elements and decay by painting or other protective covering or treatment. Peeling,
flaking and chipped paint shall be eliminated and surfaces repainted. All siding and
masonry joins, as well as those between the building envelope and the perimeter of
windows, doors and skylights, shall be maintained weather resistant and water tight.
All metal surfaces subject to rust and corrosion, coated to inhibit future rust or
corrosion shall be stabilized and coated to inhibit future rust and corrosion. Oxidation
stains shall be removed from exterior surfaces. Surfaces designed for stabilization by
oxidation are exempt from this requirement.
Section 302.3 Sidewalks and driveways, shall read as follows:
All sidewalks, walkways, stairs, driveways, parking spaces and similar areas shall be
kept in a proper state of repair, and maintained free from hazardous conditions. All
striping on parking lots including, but not limited to, appropriate color must be
maintained per applicable local, state and federal standards. New gravel driveways
are prohibited. Existing gravel driveways must be completely maintained. This
includes, but is not limited to, free from potholes, ruts, channels, growth of vegetation,
other similar obstructions, exposed dirt, and areas that allow pooling of water. If an
existing driveway is found to not be maintained at the discretion of the building official



ORDINANCE 17,404

or his or her designee, the driveway must be paved and brought up to current
standards; installing additional gravel is prohibited. Surfacemust be paved or returned
to grass (if allowed per City code).

Section 302.7-Accessorystructures, shall read as follows:

All accessory structures, included detached garages, fences and walls, shall be
maintained structurally sound in and in good repair. All fences must be built in
accordance with the requirements set forth by the City of Peoria Code.
Section 601.2 Screening requirements, shall read as follows:

All roof, ground andwall mountedmechanical equipment and utilities (e.g. air handling
equipment, compressors, duct work, transformers and elevator equipment) shall be
fully screened from view of any public rights-of-way or residential zoning district. Roof
mounted or wall mounted equipment shall be painted or screenedwith materialswhich
are consistent with the primary building color and materials. Screening materials may
include a parapet wall. decorative galvanized metal screening or louvers or screening
or louvers that are painted to blend with the principal structure. The parapet wall or
similar screening structure shall be of a height greater than the height of the
mechanical equipment being screened. Ground-mounted equipment screening shall
be constructed of the following listed items and shall be of a height greater than the
height of the mechanical equipment being screened: Evergreen planting screens with
year-round screening properties.When plantings are utilized to meet this requirement
they must be planted prior to the issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy and achieve
a substantially solid visual barrier within two (2) years. Brick, stone, reinforced
concrete, or other similar masonry materials; or Redwood, cedar, preservative
pressure treated wood, or other similar materials. Ground mounted mechanical
equipment may also be painted in the form of art to compliment the character or blend
with the design of the building or surrounding neighborhood. Such artistic screening
must be approved by the equipment owner and shall be subject to review by the
Development Review Board. Above-ground utilities and appurtenances to
underground utilities which require above-ground installation shall be screened by a
continuous planting of shrubs, with a minimum mature height equal to that of the
structure, up to eight feet. Required accessways to these utilities are exempt from the
screening provisions.

***
Sec.5-171. Conformity.

Except as otherwise provided, all electrical installation shall be in conformity with the
provisions of this article. Where no specific standards are prescribed by this article,
conformity is required with and pursuant to the International Building Code as adopted in
section 5-121, and the ~2014 National Electrical Code NFPA 70.

***
Sec.5-185. Examination of applicant for license.

(a) Before a certificate of license required by this code shall be issued to an applicant,
the applicant shall, following reasonable advance notice, present himself for examination
as instructed by the code official. The code official shall examine such applicant as to
his/her practical knowledge of the installation and alteration of electrical equipment as set



ORDINANCE 17,404

forth in the rules and regulations of this article, and in the National Electrical Code adopted
by the BOCAICC National [International] Building Code, as adopted by section 5-121 of
this Code. Such examination shall be, inwhole or in part, inwriting and shall be of practical
character, as determined by the code official; and be sufficiently strict to thoroughly test
the experience and qualifications of the applicant.

(b) The examination fee shall be $100.00 for each testing. The examination applicant
shall be responsible to have the appropriate Code books and materials needed to
complete the examination.

(c) This section shall not apply to an electrical contractor duly licensed in another
municipality in conformance with section 5-183 registering with the city.

***

Sec. 5-211. Compliance with the 20062012 International Mechanical Code
required.

The International Mechanical Code/2GOO2012 is hereby adopted by reference.
Sec. 5-212. Amendments to the International Mechanical Code/20062012.

The International Mechanical CodeJ2006as adopted in section 5/211 of this chapter,
is amended as provided in this section.

Section 101.1, Title,shall read as follm\'s:
Section 101.1. Title.These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of the
City of Peoria, hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Section 106.5.2. Fee Schedule. See Oiv. 3, Section 5 236 of the Peoria Municipal
Gede-c

Section 106.5.3.Fee refunds, is deleted in its entirety.

Section 109. Means of Appeal, is hereby amended to read as foliolNS:
Section 109.1, Construction Commission. The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the Construction Commission as established in article II
of chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code, from any decision of the code official as set forth
in Section 5 61.

Section 109.1.1 through Section 109.7, are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 301.7, Bectrical, is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 301.7, Electrical. ElectricallNiring, controls and connections to equipment and
appliances regulated by this code shall be in accordance with the current National
Electrical Code.

Section 303.O. Equipment and Appliance Location is hereby amended by adding the
following language:

Section 303.7.1 Protection of equipment. All equipment placed in a basement or
similar location that would be subject to dampness shall be raised and/or protected
from damage by minimumone inch high concrete base, one inch minimumgalvanized
steel support frame, or similar method approved by the code official



ORDINANCE 17,404

Section 306.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
The International Mechanical Code/2012 as adopted in section 5/211 of this chapter,

is amended as provided in this section.
Section 101.1, Title, shall read as follows:
Section 101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of the
City of Peoria, hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Section 106.5.2. Fee Schedule. See Div. 3, Section 5-236 of the Peoria Municipal
Code.

Section 106.5.3. Fee refunds, is deleted in its entirety.

Section 109. Means of Appeal, is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 109.1, Construction Commission. The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the Construction Commission as established in article II
of chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code, from any decision of the code official as set forth
in Section 5-61.

Section 109.1.1 through Section 109.7, are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 301.7, Electrical, is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 301.7, Electrical. Electrical wiring, controls and connections to equipment and
appliances regulated by this code shall be in accordance with the current National
Electrical Code.

Section 303. O. Equipment and Appliance Location is hereby amended by adding the
following language:

Section 303.7. 1 Protection of equipment. All equipment placed in a basement or
similar location that would be subject to dampness shall be raised and/or protected
from damage byminimum one-inch high concrete base, one-inch minimumgalvanized
steel support frame, or similar method approved by the code official.

Section 306.5 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
Section 401.2 shall not be enforced for historical buildings as defined by the IBC. It is

replaced with Section 401.2 of the 2006 International Mechanics Code.
Sec. 5-213. Compliance with the International Fuel GasCode required.

The International Fuel Gas Code/2-QOO2012is hereby adopted by reference.
Sec. 5-214. Amendments to the International Fuel GasCode.

The International Fuel Gas Code as adopted in section 5 213 is amended as
provided in this section.

Section 106.3.1. Construction documents, shall read as follows:
Section 106.3.1. Construction documents: The code official shall require drawings and
details of all mechanical and electrical work as he/she deems necessary. The Illinois
Architectural Act and the Illinois Professional Engineering Act shall be the guidelines
for minimum requirements.



ORDINANCE 17,404

Secbon 101. Title, shall read as foIlO'.\'s:

Secbon 101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of the
City of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Secbon 106.5.2. FfJe Schedule, Shall read as follows:

Secbon 106.5.2. Fee Schedule. The fees for work shall be as indicated in Oi". 3,
Section 5 236 of the Peoria City Code.

Secbon 106.5.3. Fee refunds, is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 109 Means of Appeal is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 109.1, Construction Commission. The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the construction commission as established in Article II of
Chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code from any decision of the code official as set forth in
Section 5 61 of the Peoria City Code.

Secbon 109.2 through Section 109.7, are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 309.2, Connections, is hereby amended to read as follO'.ys:

Secbon 309.2, Connections. Electrical connections between equipment and the
building wiring, including the grounding of the equipment, shall conform to the current
National Electrical Code.

The International Fuel Gas Code as adopted in section 5-213 is amended as provided
in this section.

Section 106.3.1. Construction documents, shall read as follows:

Section 106.3.1. Construction documents: The code official shall require drawings and
details of all mechanical and electrical work as he/she deems necessary. The Illinois
Architectural Act and the Illinois Professional Engineering Act shall be the guidelines
for minimum requirements.

Section 101. Title, shall read as follows:

Section 101.1. Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of the
City of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Section 106.5.2. Fee Schedule, Shall read as follows:

Section 106.5.2. Fee Schedule. The fees for work shall be as indicated in Div. 3,
Section 5-236 of the Peoria City Code.

Section 106.5.3. Fee refunds, is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 109 Means of Appeal is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 109.1, Construction Commission. The owner of a building or structure or any
other person may appeal to the construction commission as established in Article" of
Chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code from any decision of the code official as set forth in
Section 5-61 of the Peoria City Code.

Section 109.2 through Section 109.7, are hereby deleted in their entirety.

Section 309.2, Connections, is hereby amended to read as follows:



ORDINANCE 17,404

Section 309.2, Connections. Electrical connections between equipment and the
building wiring, including the grounding of the equipment. shall conform to the current
National Electrical Code.

Sec. 5-215. Compliance with the International Energy Conservation Code
required.

The International Energy Conservation Code!2006 is hereby adopted by reference.
The City of Peoria will enforce the requirements of the Energy Code as required by the
State of Illinois.
Sec. 5 216. Amendments to the International EnergyConservation Code.

The International Energy Conservation Code!2006 as adopted in section 5 215 is
amended as provided in this section.

Section 101.1. Title shall read as follows:
Section 101.1 TiUe. This code shall be knownas the International Energy Conservation
Code of the city of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

***

Sec. 5-260. Adoption of codes.

(a) The ~2012 International Property Maintenance code, First Edition as published
by the International Code Council, Inc. is hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance
Code of the City of Peoria.

(b) Where no specific standards to the contrary are prescribed by this chapter,
conformity is required with and pursuant "~2012 International Property Maintenance
Code, First Edition 2003," as amended along with all codes and standards referred to
therein.

***
Sec. 5-301. Amendments to adopted codes.

The 2003 International Property Maintenance Code as adopted in Section 5 260 is
amended as follows:

(1) 101.1 Title, shall read:
"Title." This article shall e known as the Property Maintenance Code of the City
of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

(2) Section 103.1 shall be deleted in its entirety.

(3) Section 103.2shall be deleted in its entirety.
(4) Section 103.3 shall be deleted in its entirety.
(5) Section 103.4shall be deleted in its entirety.
(6) Section 104.1 Genera!, shall read:



ORDINANCE 17,404

The code official shall enforce all of the provisions of this Code except the Fire
Marshall or his designee shall enforce Section 704.0, FIRE PROTECTION
SYSTEMS.

(7) Section 106.3 Prosecution shall be deleted in its entirety.

(8) Section 106.4 Violationpenalties, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(9) Section 107.5 Transfer of ownership shall read:

107.5 Transfer of ownership: It shall be unlavlful for the owner of any d'A'eliing
unit or structure who has received a compliance order or upon whom a notice
of violation has been served to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise
dispose of such dwelling unit or structure to another until the provision of the
compliance order or notice of violation have been complied with, or until such
owner shall first furnish the grantee, transferee, or lessee a true copy of any
compliance order or notice of violation issued by the code official and shall
furnish to the code official a signed and notarized statement from the grantee,
transferee, or lessee, acknowledging the receipt of such compliance order or
notice of violation and fully accepting the responsibility '....ithout condition for
making the corrections or repairs required by such compliance order or n.otice
of violation. This requirement shall not preclude any person from seeking a
variance or an appeal pursuant to the other sections of this code.

(10) Section 110.0 Demolition shall be deleted in its entirety.
(11) Section 111.0Means of Appeal, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(12) Section 201.3 Terms defined in other codes shall read as follows:

201.3 Terms as defined in other codes: Where terms are not defined in this
code and are defined in the International Building Code, International Fire
Code International Zoning Code, State of Illinois Plumbing Code, International
Mech~nical Code, International Existing Building code or the National Electric
Code, such terms shall have the meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.

(13) Section 202.0 Definitions Dormitory, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(14) Section 202.0 Definitions Family, shall be deleted in its entirety.
(15) Section 202.0, General Definitions, Habitable space, shall read:

Habitable space: Space in a residential structure for living, sleeping, eating or
cooking. Bathrooms, toilet rooms, halls, storage or utility spaces, and similar
areas are not considered habitable spaces.

(16) Section 301.2, Responsibility, shall read:
Responsibility. The Owner of the premises shall maintain the structures ~nd
exterior property in compliance '.\liththese requirements, except as otherWise
provided for in Sections 307.0 and 308.0 and in Sections 13 37 and 13 39 of
the Property Maintenance Code of the City of Peoria.

(17) Section 302.1 Sanitation shall be deleted in its entirety.
(18) Section 302.7 Accessory Structures, shall read:



ORDINANCE 17,404

Accessory Structures. All accessory structures, including deta.chedgarage~,
fences and walls, shall be maintained structurally sound and In good repair.
They shall be free of insects and rodents. The exterior of ea?h accessory
structure shall be 'Neather resistant. All fences on the premises shall be
constructed of manufactured metal fencing material, '....ood, masonry, or other
inert material. Such fences shall be maintained by the owner. 'Nood materials
shall be protected against decay. VVhereverany required egress doorway from
a building opens into a fenced area, there shall be a means of entrance and
exit from the premises to the nearest public way.

(19) Section 302.8 Motor 'Iehtc!es,shall be deleted in its entirety.
(20) Section 304.5 ,'=Ql:JndationWafts,shall read:

FoundationWalls. All foundation walls shall be maintained structurally safe and
sound and free from open cracks and breaks in such a condition so as to
prevent the entry of rodents.

(21) Section 304.12, Handraftsand gl:Jards:shall read
Except in single family residential dwellings built prior to 1972, every exte~ior
and interior flight of stairs having more than four risers, and e.veryopen port~on
of a stair, landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface which
is more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor or grade below shall have
guards. Handrails shall not be less than.30 inches (762 mm~nor more than 42
inches (1067 mm) high, measured vertically above the nosing of the tread or
above the finished floor of the landing or walking surfaces. Guard~shall not be
less than 30 inches (762 mm) high above the floor of the landing, balcony,
porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface. Every handrail and guard shall be
firmly fastened and capable of supporting normally imposed loads and shall be
maintained in good condition.

(22) Section 304.15 Insect Screens, shall read:
Insect Screens. During the period from April 15 to October 15, every door,
window and other outside opening utilized or required for ventilation purposes
servings any structure containing habitable rooms, fo~d preparation..area~,
food service areas, or any areas where products to be Included or utilized In
food for human consumption are processed, manufactured, packaged, or
stored, shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of ~ot less.th~n
16 mesh per inch and every s'Ningingdoor shall have a self closln~ deVice In
good working condition. Exception: screen ~oors s~all not be required where
other approved means, such as air curtains or Insect repellant fans are
employed.

(23) [Reser/ed.]
(24) Section 40.5, Overcrolllding, shall read:

Overcrowding: Dwelling units shall not be occupied by more occupants than
permitted by the minimum area requirements of Table 404.5.

Compliance with this section is not a defense to a violation of section 5 271 of
the Housing Property Maintenance Code or section 7.7 and Article 18 of the
Zoning Ordinance.



ORDINANCE 17,404

(25) Section 501.1.2 Plumbing, shall read:

Plumbing. "'''here any conflict exists between the Illinois State Plumbing Code
and the Property Maintenance Code, the more stringent shall apply.

(26) Section 505.1 General, shall read as follows:
505.1 General: Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking fountain, water
closet, or other plumbing fixture shall be properly connected to either a p~blic
water system or to an approved private water system. All kit?hen .slnks,
lavatories, laundry facilities, bathtubs and showers shall be supplied Wlt~h?t
or tempered and cold running '.vater in accordance with the State of IllinoIs
Plumbing Code.

(27) Section 602.2 Residential occldfJancies,shall read:
Residential occupancies. Every dwelling shall be provided '#ith heating
facilities capable of maintaining a room temperature of 65 degrees .F. at a
distance of 18 inches above floor level to an outdoor temperature of minus 10
degrees F. in all habitable rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms based on the
outside design temperature required for the locality by the mechanical code
listed in chapter 8.

(28) Section 602.31-1eatSupply, shall read:
Heat Supply. Every owner and operator of any building 'Nho rents, leases or
lets one or more dwelling units, rooming unit, dormitory or guestroom on terms
either expressed or implied, to furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall
supply sufficient heat during the period from September 15 ~o May 15 to
maintain the room temperature specified in Section 602.2 dUring the hours
between 8:30 a.m. and 10:30 p.m. of each day and not less than 60 degrees
F. during other hours.

(29) Section 604.2, Service shall read as follm'''s:
604.2 Service: The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall se~e
as a basis for determining the need for additional facilities in accordance 'J:'lth
the National Electrical Code. Dwelling units shall be served by a three Wire,
120/240 volt, single phase electrical service having a rating of not less than 60
amperes.

(30) Section 702.4 Emergency Escape Openings, shall read:
Emergency Escape Openings. Every sleeping room located in a basem.entin
an occupancy in Use Group I 1 or R shall have at least one openable '/t'lndow
or exterior door approved for emergency egress or rescue; or. shall h~ve
access not less than hvo approved independent exits. All reqUired outSide
windows and doors, when designed to be operable, shall be operable from the
inside without the use of tools and shall meet the follolJ"ingrequirements:

(a) if built prior to 1972, subject to the 1985 Life Safety Code 101;
(b) if built after 1972, subject to the Building Code in effect for that year.

(31) [ResePied.]



ORDINANCE 17,404

(32) Section 704.1.1 Enforcement.

The Fire Marshall or his designee shall enforce all of the provisions of Section
705.0 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS in accordance with Chapter 11 of the
Peoria City Code.

(33) Section 202.0 General Definitions, Obsolete Signs shall read:

Any sign including the sign structure, retractable canopy or awning, 'A'h!ch
advertises a business no longer being conducted or a product no longer being
sold in or from the premises to which the sign relates is considered obsolete.
Signs left in good repair which remove all aspects of former business and
present a solid color blank slate are not considered obsolete.

(34) Section 304.2 Protective treatment shall read:

All exterior surfaces, including but not limited to, doors, door and INindoVI
frames, exterior signs, cornices, porches, trim, balconies, decks and fences,
shall be maintained in good condition. Obsolete signs are prohibited and
considered not to be in good condition. Exterior signs not being maintained
include but is not limited to exposed wires, peeling paint, damaged surfaces
and missing components. Exterior wood surfaces, other than decay resistant
woods, shall be protected from the elements and decay by painting or other
protective covering or treatment. Peeling, flaking and chipp~d.paint shall be
eliminated and surfaces repainted. All siding and masonry JOinS,as 'A'ell as
those between the building envelope and the perimeter of windmus, doors and
skylights, shall be maintained weather resista~t ~n? water tight. All m~tal
surfaces subject to rust and corrosion, coated to Inhibit future ru~t or co~ros~on
shall be stabilized and coated to inhibit future rust and corrosion. OXidation
stains shall be removed from exterior surfaces. Surfaces designed for
stabilization by oxidation are exempt from this requirement.

(35) Section 302.3 Side'l.'8lksand driveways shall read:
All sidewalks, walkways, stairs, driveways, parking spaces and similar areas
shall be kept in a proper state of repair, and maintained.fr~e from hazard?us
conditions. All striping on parking lots including, but not limited to, appropriate
color must be maintained per applicable local, state and federal standards.
New gravel driveways are prohibited. Existing gravel drivelA'ays must be
completely maintained. This includes, but is not limited to, free from pothol~s,
ruts, channels, growth of vegetation, other si.mi.laro~structio.ns,exposed dirt,
and areas that allow pooling of water. If an eXistingdriveway ISfoun~ to not be
maintained at the discretion of the building official or his or her deSignee,the
driveway must be paved and brought up to current standards; installin~
additional gravel is prohibited. Surface must be paved or returned to grass (If
allowed per City code).

(36) Section 302.7 Accessory structures shall read:
All accessory structures, included detached garages, fences and walls, sh~1I
be maintained structurally sound in and in good repair. All fences must be bUilt
in accordance with the requirements set forth by the City of Peoria Code.

(37) Seotion 601.2 Screening requirements shall read:



ORDINANCE 17,404

All roof, ground and wall mounted mechanical equipment and utilities (e.g. air
handling equipment, compressors, duct work, transformers and elevator
equipment) shall be fully screened from view of any public rights of way or
residential zoning district. Roof mounted or wall mounted equipment shall be
painted or screened '.vith materials which are consistent with the primary
building color and materials. Screening materials may include a parapet wall,
decorative galvanized metal screening or louvers or screening or louvers that
are painted to blend with the principal structure. The parapet wall or similar
screening structure shall be of a height greater than the height of the
mechanical equipment being screened. Ground mounted equipment
screening shall be constructed of the following listed items and shall be of a
height greater than the height of the mechanical equipment being screened:
Evergreen planting screens with year round screening properties. When
plantings are utilized to meet this requirement they must be planted prior to the
issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy and achieve a substantially solid visual
barrier within two (2) years. Brick, stone, reinforced concrete, or other similar
masonry materials; or Redwood, cedar, preservative pressure treated 'Nood,
or other similar materials. Ground mounted mechanical equipment may also
be painted in the form of art to compliment the character or blend 'A'iththe
design of the building or surrounding neighborhood. Such artistic screening
must be approved by the equipment owner and shall be subject to review by
the Development Review Board. Above ground utilities and appurtenances to
underground utilitieswhich require above ground installation shall be screened
by a continuous planting of shrubs, with a minimummature height equal to that
of the structure, up to eight feet. Required accessways to these utilities are
exempt from the screening provisions.

The 2012 International Property Maintenance Code as adopted in section 5-125, is
amended as follows:

Section 101.1, Title, is amended to read as follows:
101.1 "Title."This article shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code of the City
of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Sections 103.1, 103.2, 103.3 and 103.5 are deleted in their entirety.

Section 104.1, General, shall read:
This code official shall enforce all of the provisions of this code except the Fire Marshal
or his designee shall enforce Section 704.0 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS.

Section 106.3, Prosecution of violation, shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section 106.4, Violationpenalties, is hereby amended to read as follows:
106.4, Violationpenalties.Any personwho shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof shall, upon conviction thereof, be
subject to a fine of not more than $500.00. Each day that a violation continues after
due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 107.5, Transfer of ownership, is hereby amended to read as follows:
107.5 Transfer of ownership: It shall be unlawful for the owner of any dwelling unit or
structurewho has received a compliance order or uponwhom a notice of violation has



ORDINANCE 17,404

been served to sell. transfer, mortgage, lease or otherwise dispose of such dwelling
unit or structure to another until the provision of the compliance order or notice of
violation have been complied with, or until such owner shall first furnish the grantee,
transferee, or lessee a true copy of any compliance order or notice of violation issued
by the code official and shall furnish to the code official a signed and notarized
statement from the grantee, transferee, or lessee, acknowledging the receipt of such
compliance order or notice of violation and fully accepting the responsibility with
condition for making the corrections or repairs required by such compliance order or
notice of violation. This requirement shall not preclude any person from seeking a
variance or an appeal pursuant to the other sections of this code.

Section 110.0, Demolition, shall be deleted in its entirety.

Section 111.0, Means of Appea" shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section 201.3 Termsdefined in other codes shall read as follows:

201.3 Terms as defined in other codes: Where terms are not defined in this code and
are defined in the International Building Code, International Fire Code, International
Zoning Code, State of Illinois Plumbing Code, International Mechanical Code,
International Existing Building code or the National Electric Code, such terms shall
have the meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.

Section 301.2, Responsibility, shall read:

Responsibility. The Owner of the premises shall maintain the structures and exterior
property in compliance with these requirements, except as otherwise provided for in
Sections 307.0 and 308.0 and in sections 13-37 and 13-39 of the Property
Maintenance Code of the City of Peoria.

Section 302.1, Sanitation, shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section 302.7, Accessory Structures, shall read:

Accessory Structures. All accessory structures, including detached garages, fences
andwalls, shall be maintained structurally sound and in good repair. They shall be free
of insects and rodents. The exterior of each accessory structure shall be weather
resistant. All fences on the premises shall be constructed of manufactured metal
fencing material. wood, masonry, or other inert material. Such fences shall be
maintained by the owner.Wood materials shall be protected against decay. Wherever
any required egress doorway from a building opens into a fenced area, there shall be
a means of entrance and exit from the premises to the nearest public way.

Section 304.5, Foundation, Walls, shall read:

Foundation Walls.All foundation walls shall be maintained structurally safe and sound
and free from open cracks and breaks in such a condition so as to prevent the entry
of rodents.

Section 304.12. Handrails and guards, shall read:
Except in single-family residential dwellings built prior to 1972, every exterior and
interior flight of stairs having more than four risers, and every open portion of a stair
landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface which is more than 30
inches (762mm) above the floor or grade below shall have guards. Handrails shall not
be less than 30 inches (762 mm) nor more than 42 inches (1067 mm) high, measured



ORDINANCE 17,404

vertically above the nosing of the tread or above the finished floor of the landing or
walking surfaces. Guards shall not be less than 30 inches (762 mm) high above the
floor of the landing, balcony, porch, deck, ramp or other walking surface. Every
handrail and guard shall be firmly fastened and capable of supporting normally
imposed loads and shall be maintained in good condition.

Section 304.14 Insect Screens, shall read:
Insect Screens. During the period from April 15 to October 15, every door, window and
other outside opening utilized or required for ventilation purposes servings any
structure containing habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food service areas, or
any areas where products to be included or utilized in food for human consumption
are processed, manufactured, packaged, or stored, shall be supplied with approved
tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh per inch and every swinging door shall
have a self-closing device in good working condition. Exception: screen doors shall
not be required where other approved means, such as air curtains or insect repellant
fans are employed.

Section 404.5, Overcrowding, shall read:
Overcrowding: Dwelling units shall not be occupied by more occupants than permitted
by the minimum area requirements of Table 404.5.

Compliance with this section is not a defense to a violation of section 5-271 of the
Housing Property Maintenance Code or section 7.7 and Article 18 of the Zoning
Ordinance.

Section 501.1.2, Plumbing, shall read:
Plumbing. Where any conflict exists between the Illinois State Plumbing Code and
Property Maintenance Code the more stringent shall apply.

Section 505.1General, shall read as follows:
505.1 General: Every sink, lavatory, bathtub or shower, drinking fountain, water closet.
or other plumbing fixture shall be properly connected to either a public water system
or to an approved privatewater system. All kitchen sinks, lavatories, laundry facilities,
bathtubs and showers shall be supplied with hot or tempered and cold running water
in accordance with the State of Illinois Plumbing Code.

Section 602.2 Residential occupancies, shall read:
Residential occupancies. Every dwelling shall be provided with heating facilities
capable of maintaining a room temperature of 65 degrees F. at a distance of 18 inches
above floor level to an outdoor temperature of minus 10 degrees F. in all habitable
rooms, bathrooms and toilet rooms based on the outside design temperature required
for the locality by the mechanical code listed in chapter 8.

Section 602.3 Heat Supply, shall read:
Heat Supply. Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one
or more dwelling units, rooming unit. dormitory or guestroom on terms either
expressed or implied, to furnish heat to the occupants thereof shall supply sufficient
heat during the period from September 15 to May 15 to maintain the room temperature



ORDINANCE 17,404

specified in Section 602.2 during the hours between 8:30 a.m. and 10:30 p.m. of each
day and not less than 60 degrees F. during other hours.

Section 602.4, Occupiable work spaces, shall read:
Occupiable work spaces: Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat
during the period from September 15th to May 15th to maintain a temperature of not
less than 65 degrees (18 degrees C.) during the period the spaces are occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special
temperature conditions.
2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical activities.

3. Warehousing or similar facilities.
Section 604.2, Service shall read as follows:
604.2 Service:The size and usage of appliances and equipment shall serve as a basis
for determining the need for additional facilities in accordance with the National
Electrical Code. Dwelling units shall be served by a three-wire, 120/240 volt. single­
phase electrical service having a rating of not less than 60 amperes.

Section 704.1.1 Enforcement, shall read:
The Fire Marshall or his designee shall enforce all of the provisions of Section 704.0
FIRE PREVENTION SYSTEMS in accordance with Chapter 11 of the Peoria City
Code

Section 702.4 Emergency Escape Openings, shall read:
Emergency Escape Openings. Every sleeping room located in a basement in an
occupancy in Use Group 1-1or R shall have at least one openable window or exterior
door approved for emergency egress or rescue; or shall have access not less than two
approved independent exits. All required outside windows and doors, when designed
to be operable, shall be operable from the inside without the use of tools and shall
meet the following requirements:

(a) if built prior to 1972, subject to the 1985 Life Safety Code 101;
(b) if built after 1972, subject to the Building Code in effect for that year.

Section 101.1 Title, shall read:
101.1 "Title"This regulation article shall be known as the Property Maintenance Code
of the City of Peoria hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Section 202.0, Definitions; Rubbish, shall read as follows:
Rubbish: Combustible and noncombustiblewaste materials, except garbage; the term
shall include the residue from the burning of wood, coal. coke and other combustible
materials, paper, rags, cartons, boxes, household furniture such as sofas, stuffed
chairs and mattresses when found on the exterior of the property, wood, excelsior,
rubber, leather, tree branches, yard trimmings, tin cans, metals, mineral matter, glass,
crockery and dust and other similar materials.



ORDINANCE 17,404

Section 301.2, Responsibilitv, shall read:
"Responsibilitv."The Owner of the premises shall maintain the structures and exterior
property in compliance with these requirements, except as otherwise provided for in
Section 307.0 and 308.0 and in Sections 13-37and 13-39of the Property Maintenance
Code of the City of Peoria.

Section 302.1 Sanitation, shall be deleted in its entirety.
Section 302.5 Rodent Harborage, shall read as follows:
"RodentHarborage."All structures and exterior property shall be kept free from rodent
harborage and infestation. All exterior wood, construction materials or other stored
items shall be stored in a rodent proof manner such as elevating the materials 12
inches above the earth, enclosing the materials in rodent proof containers, utilizing an
extermination process or other approved methods. The Code Official may request
verification that the property has been baited. Where rats are found, they shall be
properly exterminated by approved processes, which will not be injurious to human
health. After extermination, proper precautions shall be taken to eliminate rodent
harborage and prevent reinfestation.

Section 308.1 Accumulation of rubbish and garbage, shall read as follows:
"Accumulation of rubbish and garbage." All exterior property and premises, and the
interior of every structure shall be free from any accumulation of rubbish and garbage.
The owner and/or occupant of a single-family structure shall have the responsibility to
maintain the premises free from litter.

Section 308.2.1 Rubbish Storage Facilities, shall read as follows:
"Rubbish Storage Facilities." The owner of every two-family and multiple-family
premises shall supply approved covered containers for rubbish, and the owner of the
premises shall be responsible for the removal of rubbish.

Section 308.3.1 Garbage Facilities, shall read as follows:
"Garbage Facilities."The owner of every two-family and multiple family dwelling shall
supply one of the following: an approved mechanical waste grinder in each dwelling
unit; an approved incinerator unit in the structure available to the occupants in each
dwelling unit or an approved leakproof, covered, outside garbage container.

Section 202.0, General Definitions, Obsolete Signs, shall read as follows:

Any sign including the sign structure, retractable canopy or awning, which advertises
a business no longer being conducted or a product no longer being sold in or from the
premises to which the sign relates is considered obsolete. Signs left in good repair
which remove all aspects of former business and present a solid color blank slate are
not considered obsolete.
Section 304.2 Protective treatment, shall read as follows:
All exterior surfaces, including but not limited to, doors, door and window frames,
exterior signs, cornices, porches, trim, balconies, decks and fences, shall be
maintained in good condition. Obsolete signs are prohibited and considered not to be
in good condition. Exterior signs not being maintained include but is not limited to
exposed wires, peeling paint, damaged surfaces and missing components. Exterior



ORDINANCE 17,404

wood surfaces. other than decay-resistant woods, shall be protected from the
elements and decay by painting or other protective covering or treatment. Peeling,
flaking and chipped paint shall be eliminated and surfaces repainted. All siding and
masonry joins, as well as those between the building envelope and the perimeter of
windows, doors and skylights, shall be maintained weather resistant and water tight.
All metal surfaces subject to rust and corrosion, coated to inhibit future rust or
corrosion shall be stabilized and coated to inhibit future rust and corrosion. Oxidation
stains shall be removed from exterior surfaces. Surfaces designed for stabilization by
oxidation are exempt from this requirement.
Section 302.3 Sidewalks and driveways, shall read as follows:
All sidewalks, walkways, stairs, driveways, parking spaces and similar areas shall be
kept in a proper state of repair, and maintained free from hazardous conditions. All
striping on parking lots including, but not limited to. appropriate color must be
maintained per applicable local. state and federal standards. New gravel driveways
are prohibited. Existing gravel driveways must be completely maintained. This
includes, but is not limited to, free from potholes, ruts, channels. growth of vegetation,
other similar obstructions, exposed dirt. and areas that allow pooling of water. If an
existing driveway is found to not be maintained at the discretion of the building official
or his or her designee, the driveway must be paved and brought up to current
standards; installing additional gravel is prohibited. Surfacemust be paved or returned
to grass (if allowed per City code).
Section 302.7 Accessory structures, shall read as follows:
All accessory structures, included detached garages. fences and walls, shall be
maintained structurally sound in and in good repair. All fences must be built in
accordance with the requirements set forth by the City of Peoria Code.
Section 601.2 Screening requirements, shall read as follows:

All roof, ground andwall mounted mechanical equipment and utilities (e.g. air handling
equipment. compressors. duct work, transformers and elevator equipment) shall be
fully screened from view of any public rights-of-way or residential zoning district. Roof
mounted or wall mountedequipment shall be painted or screenedwith materialswhich
are consistent with the primary building color and materials. Screening materials may
include a parapet wall. decorative galvanized metal screening or louvers or screening
or louvers that are painted to blend with the principal structure. The parapet wall or
similar screening structure shall be of a height greater than the height of the
mechanical equipment being screened. Ground-mounted equipment screening shall
be constructed of the following listed items and shall be of a height greater than the
height of the mechanical equipment being screened: Evergreen planting screens with
year-round screening properties.When plantings are utilized to meet this requirement
they must be planted prior to the issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy and achieve
a substantially solid visual barrier within two (2) years. Brick. stone, reinforced
concrete, or other similar masonry materials; or Redwood, cedar, preservative
pressure treated wood, or other similar materials. Ground mounted mechanical
equipment may also be painted in the form of art to compliment the character or blend
with the design of the building or surrounding neighborhood. Such artistic screening
must be approved by the equipment owner and shall be subject to review by the
Development Review Board. Above-ground utilities and appurtenances to
underground utilities which require above-ground installation shall be screened by a

-~-~-- --- --------- - - - - - -



ORDINANCE 17,404

continuous planting of shrubs, with a minimum mature height equal to that of the
structure, up to eight feet. Required accessways to these utilities are exempt from the
screening proviSions.

***

SECTION 2. After its passage and publication in pamphlet form, this Ordinance shall
be in effect on January 1, 2017.

PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF PEORIA, ILLINOIS this ~day

of October, 2016.

APPROVED:

ATTEST:

'- ... v-... .,,::.....
(' '""_',

\
EXAMINEDAND P.PPROVED:

l:rd!iu:L
\_


